
International

We are living in an interconnected global economy. Legal disputes and 
transactions between companies on the international stage require more 
than just legal expertise – they demand a deep understanding of cultural 
nuances, business expectations, and regulatory complexities. Our firm has 
extensive experience advising clients with international claims, including 
those related to structuring transactions, mitigating legal risks, and resolving
disputes in U.S. courts and arbitration forums. Whether structuring a deal or 
resolving a dispute, we ensure our clients are well-equipped to navigate the 
complexities of U.S. law with confidence.

We have significant experience managing cross-border disputes and 
litigation, whether in U.S. courts or international arbitration forums. We guide
clients through every stage of the dispute resolution process. We advise 
clients on structuring and drafting international transactions to minimize risk 
and comply with international rules and laws. When an international 
transaction goes sideways, we help clients navigate the process of 
recovering and defending international claims. When needed, we leverage 
our international networks by collaborating with trusted legal partners to 
ensure seamless cross-border representation.

Representative Matters

Represented a NY-based boutique investment bank to a successful outcome 
in an international arbitration, leading to a multimillion dollar arbitration 
award that was recently confirmed by the SDNY.

Represented NYC fashion show in connection with an international arbitration
with a fashion label.

Represented multinational telecommunications company in bribery and 
corruption investigations (internal and governmental) in Asia, Africa, and the 
Middle East, resulting in no action taken by US or UK regulators.

Prepared and negotiated various entertainment and distribution contracts.

Representation in negotiations and preparation of product distribution 
agreements, leases, licensing and sales. Representation in prosecution and 
defense of contract breach and fraud.
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Travel to Guinea-Conakry and negotiate with government officials and 
parties concerning licensing, operations and distribution.

Travel to Papua New Guinea and negotiate with government officials and 
parties concerning foreign investment, technology, licensing and operations.

Counseled a cable provider in licensing and copyright litigation over the 
broadcast and retransmission of content.

Represented the estate of a celebrity in litigation involving right of publicity 
and unauthorized use of name and likeness.

Represented investors in litigation alleging fraud and misappropriation of 
funds by executives of a Hong Kong-based investment company.

Defended chairman of the board in a shareholder derivative action asserting 
breaches of fiduciary duty and corporate waste against the directors and 
officers of a China-based tech firm.

Defendant board member in a derivative action alleging mismanagement 
and breach of fiduciary duty by corporate officers of a publicly traded 
company.

Represented law firm and attorney against claims arising under escrow 
agreement. Obtained order compelling arbitration.

Represented fashion label and principal in dispute with sourcing agent. 
Obtained summary judgment awarding damages against the sourcing agent 
and dismissal of all counterclaims.

Represented a garment manufacturer in claim for non-payment. Successfully
recovered payment for the client.

Defended client against enforcement of an arbitral award in New York. 
Obtained judgment dismissing petition to confirm award in New York.

Defended vendor against bankruptcy preference and voidable transfer claim.

Represented a garment manufacturer in claim for non-payment. Successfully
recovered payment for client.

Represented lendor in action against borrow for breach of stock pledge loan.

Represented stock lender in action against pledgee for return of stock.

Represented escrow agent in action against escrowee for fraud and 
misappropriation.
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